
 

    

 

FOI_1261_2023-24 – FOI Request Concerning – Management Information 
System 
 
1. The number of Ulysses reports made identifying staffing shortages or referencing 

staffing shortages on all mental wards in the calendar year 2019. 
 

10 
 
2. The number of Ulysses reports made identifying staffing shortages or referencing 

staffing shortages on all mental wards in the calendar year 2020. 
 

13 
 
3. The number of Ulysses reports made identifying staffing shortages or referencing 

staffing shortages on all mental wards in the calendar year 2021. 
 

13 
 
4. The number of Ulysses reports made identifying staffing shortages or referencing 

staffing shortages on all mental wards in the calendar year 2022. 
 

22 
 
5. The number of Ulysses reports made identifying staffing shortages or referencing 

staffing shortages on all mental wards so far in this calendar year, 2023.  
 

8 
 
6. The number of shifts on all mental wards that were flagged as not meeting minimum 

nurse staffing levels in the calendar year 2019. 
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 
7. The number of shifts on all mental wards that were flagged as not meeting minimum 

nurse staffing levels in the calendar year 2020. 
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 
8. The number of shifts on all mental wards that were flagged as not meeting minimum 

nurse staffing levels in the calendar year 2021.  
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 
 
9. The number of shifts on all mental wards that were flagged as not meeting minimum 

nurse staffing levels in the calendar year 2022.  
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 



 

 

10. The number of shifts on all mental wards that were flagged as not meeting minimum 
nurse staffing levels so far in this calendar year, 2023.   

 
This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 

11. The total number of shifts available in the calendar year 2019.    
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 

12. The total number of shifts available in the calendar year 2020.    
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 

13. The total number of shifts available in the calendar year 2021.    
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 

14. The total number of shifts available in the calendar year 2022.  
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
   

15. The total number of shifts available in the calendar year 2023.  
 

This information is not recorded on Ulysses 
 

 
 


